
PROFESSOR IN CLINICAL PHARMACY 
 (No : 64948) 

 
 
 
Université Laval, one of the oldest educational institution in Canada and the first in North America to 
offer higher education in French, is seeking applications for a full professor position in the area of 
clinical pharmacy. This position involves teaching and research activities on the use of 
pharmacotherapy in humans, and it encompasses the evaluation of technologies and intervention 
modes used in pharmacy and across the healthcare system.  

 
JOB DESCRIPTION  
 
The successful candidate will have a tenure-track position at the Faculty of Pharmacy. She or he must 
participate in teaching undergraduate or graduate students enrolled in any of the professional study 
programs of the Faculty. She or he will also have to assume leadership in the conduct of scientific 
projects related to pharmacy, whether on clinical themes (research integrated into care), 
technological, professional or evaluative. She or he will have to supervise or co-supervise M.Sc. and 
Ph.D. students.  
 
QUALIFICATIONS  
 
All candidates must have a Ph.D. (or the equivalent for non-holders of a Ph.D. *) in pharmacy, 
pharmacoepidemiology, pharmaceutical sciences or another relevant discipline related to the fields 
described above. Completion of a postdoctoral fellowship (or equivalent) is considered an asset. 
Already having a licence to practice pharmacy issued by the Quebec Board of Pharmacists (OPQ) or in 
other field of health is considered an asset. He or she must have research skills such as the potential 
to find funding and to publish articles in peer-reviewed journals. The candidate must be able to teach 
in French and have university teaching experience. 
 
* equivalent for non-holders of a Ph.D.: https://www.pha.ulaval.ca/cms/site/pha/pharmacie/faculte-
pharmacie/publications 

 
POSITION START DATE: January 10, 2022 at the latest 
 
In accordance with the requirements of the Department of Immigration Canada, this offer is intended 
primarily for Canadian citizens and residents and permanent residents of Canada. However, non-
Canadian candidates will be considered. Université Laval is strongly committed to employment equity 
within its community, and to recruiting a diverse group of faculty and staff. The University encourages 
applications from all qualified candidates, including women, members of visible minorities, Aboriginal 
persons, members of sexual minorities, persons with disabilities, and others who may contribute to 
diversification. 
 
Please send by email, before September 1st, 2021 at midnight (EDT), a letter of intent, a curriculum 
vitae as well as a summary of teaching and research interests to the attention of the Dean at the 
following email address: decanat@pha.ulaval.ca  
 

Adopted by the Professors Assembly Unit, May 18th 2021 (A.U.-2021-34) 
For more information, visit our web site at www.pha.ulaval.ca  
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